exiler

|            | Ļ   | Draft letter to Gary Fishbein re: , Review   | 1.00 | \$275.00  |
|------------|-----|--|------|-----------|
|            | LV  | Preparation of Response to Petition for Dissolution of Marriage; Draft letter to client re:  | 0.50 | \$137.50  |
|            | LV  | Review emails from client and Gary Fishbein re:; Telephone call with Robert C. Brandt and Irwin Nachimson (Courtesy discount \$110 - no charge)                                    | 0.40 | No Charge |
| 08/26/2016 | LV  | Telephone call with client re:  Gary Fishbein; Email correspondence to Gary Fishbein; Email correspondence to client's Realtors; Review issues re:                                 | 0.80 | \$220.00  |
| 08/27/2016 | RCB | Review data re:  | 0.50 | \$387.50  |
|            | LV  | Draft Memorandum of Points and Authorities in support of Request for Orders re: temporary spousal support and attorneys fees and costs   | 2.50 | \$687.50  |
|            | LV  | Draft Declaration of client; Draft Declaration of Robert C. Brandt, Esq. in support of Request for Orders re: temporary spousal support and attorneys fees and costs               | 1.70 | \$467.50  |
| 08/28/2016 | RCB | Review NKSF retainer; Correspondence to client re:   | 0.70 | \$542.50  |
| 08/29/2016 | RCB | Correspondence with opposing counsel; Further review   | 0.50 | \$387.50  |
|            | RCB | Correspondence to NKSF re: Revise Revise;  | 0.40 | \$310.00  |
|            | LV  | Telephone call with client re:  , Draft letter to real estate agent re:  Review and respond to email from Gary Fishbein  | 0.80 | \$220.00  |
|            | LV  | Telephone call with Carolyn Shapiro at Irwin Nachimson's office re:  | 0.30 | \$82.50   |
| 08/30/2016 | RCB | Review status  | 0.30 | \$232.50  |
| exiph ex   | LV  | Exchange email correspondence with client; Email correspondence to Gary Fishbein re:  Telephone call with Irwin Nachimson issues; Review email correspondence from Irwin Nachimson | 0.60 | \$165.00  |
| 08/31/2016 | RCB | Telephone call with client re: Correspondence with opposing counsel  | 0.70 | \$542.50  |
|            |     |  |      |           |

10391

exign

| RCF     | Review Telephone call with client and opposing counsel   | 0.60 | \$465.00  |
|---------|--|------|-----------|
| W.S.I   | F Review   | 0.60 | \$417.00  |
| LV      | Further review issues (Courtesy discount - no charge)  | 0.20 | No Charge |
| LV      | Multiple telephone calls with client re:  and Order re: Advance from Community; Draft letter to Gary Fishbein re: Free Free Free Free Free Free Free F   | 1.50 | \$412.50  |
| LV      | Prepare Request for Production of Documents  , Prepare Family Law Form  Interrogatories; Draft letter to Gary Fishbein re:   | 1.60 | \$440.00  |
| )16 RCI | Correspondence with opposing counsel re: Telephone call with Irwin Nachimson   | 0.30 | \$232.50  |
| LV      | Review email correspondence from Gary Fishbein and Robert C. Brandt re:  | 1.60 | \$440.00  |
| 016 LV  | Telephone conference with Chris Lee at NKSF; Review email and voicemail from Chris Lee; Review issues re:  Review and respond to email correspondence from Gary Fishbein; Review   | 0.80 | \$220.00  |
| 016 RC  | B Telephone call with client re:   | 0.30 | \$232.50  |
| LV      | Telephone call from Irwin Nachimson re:  Email correspondence to Irwin  Nachimson re:  | 0.30 | \$82.50   |
| LV      | Review revised Confidentiality Agreement provided by Gary Fishbein;<br>Compare to original draft from August 25, 2016; Email correspondence<br>to client re: The provided Confidentiality Agreement provided by Gary Fishbein; | 0.90 | \$247.50  |
| LV      | Telephone call with Gary Fishbein and Robert C. Brandt re:  ; Telephone call with client re: email correspondence from Gary Fishbein re: (Courtesy discount \$137.50 - no charge)  | 0.50 | No Charge |
| 016 RC  | B Review Commence Correspondence to opposing counsel restaurant Correspondence to client res   | 1.10 | \$852.50  |
| 016 RC  |  |      | Commence  |

exilar

|            | LV   | Review email from Gary Fishbein; Elivery Irwin Nachimson; Review Exchange emails with client            | mail correspondence to client  | P. P.         | \$247.50    |
|------------|------|---|--------------------------------|---------------|-------------|
| 09/08/2016 | RCB  | Review  |                                | 0.20          | \$155.00    |
|            | RCB  | Commence review of opposing councorrespondence with   | sel September 7, 2016          | 0.80          | \$620.00    |
| etier e    | LV   | Review letter from Gary Fishbein and, Draft letter to Irwin Nachi emails with Gary Fishbein, client and | mson re; , Exchange seve       |               | \$440.00    |
| TRA        | LV   | Review email correspondence from client re:   | lient; Several telephone calls | from 0.60     | \$165.00    |
| 09/09/2016 | LV   | Telephone call from client; Review e<br>(Courtesy discount - no charge)                                 | mail correspondence from cli   | ent 0.20      | No Charge   |
|            | .p.A |   | Current Charges                | 37.10         | \$14,124.50 |
| EXPENSES   |      |   |                                |               |             |
| 09/06/2016 | LO   | OS ANGELES SUPERIOR COURT; F  | iling Fee for Stipulation      |               | \$20.00     |
| 09/07/2016 |      | OS ANGELES SUPERIOR COURT; Filing Fee for Response  |                                |               |             |
| 09/07/2016 |      |   |                                |               |             |
|            |      |   | Total Expenses                 | AP PP         | \$471.50    |
|            |      |   |                                |               |             |
|            | To   | tal fees and expenses incurred  | APP REP. REP.                  | \$14,596.00   |             |
|            |      | Total Curre   | nt Charges                     | \$14,596.00   |             |
|            |      | ss Payment from client's retainer funds<br>current invoice  | exist exist                    | (\$14,596.00) |             |
|            | Ne   | w balance of client retainer funds  | \$5,404.00                     |               |             |
| et e       |      | ditional funds required to bring<br>ent retainer balance to   | \$25,000.00                    | \$19,596.00   |             |
|            |      |   | Total Due                      | \$19,596.00   |             |
|            |      |   |                                |               |             |

exter

exilar

## Client Retainer Funds Detail Since Last Invoice

|            |  | Receipt        | Payment | Adjustment    | Balance     |
|------------|--|----------------|---------|---------------|-------------|
| 08/26/2016 | Payment to Account Check #1299                   | \$25,000.00    | LOV YOU | - Agy         | \$25,000.00 |
| 08/29/2016 | NIGRO KARLIN SEGAL FELDSTEIN &                   | - (\$5,000.00) |         | et -e         | \$20,000.00 |
|            | BOLNO<br>ISAACS 10391.002                        |                |         |               |             |
|            | ACCOUNTANT RETAINER                              |                |         |               |             |
| 09/16/2016 | Payment from Account on current invoice # 128950 |                |         | (\$14,596.00) | \$5,404.00  |

| Attorney Summary      |       |       | exign exign |  |
|-----------------------|-------|-------|-------------|--|
| Name                  | Hours | Rate  | Amount      |  |
| Brandt, Robert C.     | 2.60  | \$0   | No Charge   |  |
| Brandt, Robert C.     | 11.30 | \$775 | \$8,757.50  |  |
| Fingerett, Wallace S. | 0.60  | \$695 | \$417.00    |  |
| Vartanian, Lucy       | 4.60  | \$0   | No Charge   |  |
| Vartanian, Lucy       | 18.00 | \$275 | \$4,950.00  |  |
|                       | 37.10 | The - | \$14,124.50 |  |

exilar